

31. Motor Cars for Sale

TOWNLINEMOTORS LTD. R.R. 3, Stouffville 473-2627



We have always a large selection of certified used VOLKSWAGENS for sale

1974 VENTURA, 6 cylinder automatic, tape deck and speakers, \$2,000 dollars, as is, or best offer. Call after 5 p.m. 640-5227.

1973 LAMANS sports coupe, bucket seats, excellent condition. Pioneer sound system. Asking \$3,200. Call 640-4507 after 5:00 p.m.

1974 DODGE Coronet 500, PB & S Console, radio. Good condition. \$600.00 or best offer. Uncertified, 640-1407, evenings.

39. Farm Items Larry Beach Ballantrae Shop 640-2872 Res. 640-1529

SNOW PLOWING MOBILE WASHING & DE-GREASING Heavy Equipment House siding Farm machinery Trucks

CUSTOM PLOWING \$6.00 an acre 649-5227

HAY AND STRAW wanted any quantity. Powell and Co. Ltd. Call 884-2518 between 7:30 a.m. and 5:30 p.m. Monday to Friday.

FARM SERVICE DEAD HORSES OR AND CRIPPLED CATTLE Picked up promptly CALL WOODVILLE 705-439-2421

FORAGE BOX SPECIAL Loadmaster forage boxes on Martin 9 ton wagon with 11L x 15.8 ply tires, 16 ft. with 3 beater. Only a few left, at \$240.00 each.

CO-OP Complete Feed service Horse Feed Home & Farm Hardware We buy and sell Feed Grains U.C.O. CLAREMONT 649-2112 1116

FOR SALE - About 2000 bales of hay, 1st and 2nd cut, 1st class, also straw, and raspberry plants, 640-1870.

MIXED shavings 3/4-4 ton load, 294-2591.

WHEAT cleaned and treated, Frederick and Genesee, H. Rawluk 895-4121. 3W13

USED SILO wanted and used good quality mixed hay 90 cents per bale. Phone 294-0514.

44. Building Trades

31. Motor Cars for Sale

1966 SIX cylinder Chev, 250 motor, and or parts, 640-1445.

1971 FORD 2 door, automatic, P-3, radio, extra rims and snow. Runs excellent. Best offer. 649-2205.

72 MONTEGO MX Brougham 4 dr. V8, Auto, P.S., P.B. 31,000 miles, cert. perfect condition \$2,250.00. Call after 6 p.m.

1968 FORD F100 pickup Ranger cab, 360V8, auto, radio, P.B. 31,000 miles, A-1 throughout, \$1,495 or offer. 640-1278, evenings.

1969 DODGE 1/2 ton truck slant 6 engine, standard transmission, runs well. Must sell. \$950.00. Phone 643-3207.

74 GMC dump truck, with 13 speed, Call 655-3178.

33. Trailers for Sale 14 FT. TRAILER, Rally 14, fully equipped, toilet, furnace, clothes cupboard, \$2,295.00. 640-1926.

34. Motorcycles 1974 KAWASAKI KM100, Excellent condition, must sell. \$475.00. 473-2313.

39. Farm Items Shop 640-2872 Res. 640-1529

SNOW PLOWING MOBILE WASHING & DE-GREASING Heavy Equipment House siding Farm machinery Trucks

CUSTOM PLOWING \$6.00 an acre 649-5227

HAY for sale, 1st and 2nd cutting, 640-2646.

40. Farm Machinery NEW IDEA picker sheller 27-324. 4 dr. V8, Auto, P.S., P.B. 31,000 miles, cert. perfect condition \$2,250.00. Call after 6 p.m.

41. Livestock for Sale BOARDING Box Stalls, Indoor Arena, Reasonable rates. 852-6872 4W15

PUREBRED Spot hogs, serviceable age, 640-1297. 2W16

SHEEP, 4 year old, Hamp brown, ram, proven, purebred, 727-8735. 2W17

1975 CHAMPION Command Pony, Reg'd. Pinto Gelding, 13.2" HH, \$275. 473-2313.

3/4 SEMMENTAL bulls - 16 months, quiet and easy to handle. Sired by LACOMBE ACHILLES, SIGNAL and CANADIAN SALVATOR. Morris, Jericho Farm, R. R. 4, Port Perry Phone 852-7359 (10 a.m. - 5 p.m. only).

HORSE AUCTION Monday, September 20th, 6:00 p.m. at Stouffville Stockyards. 100 registered and grade horses of all breeds. Several quiet children's saddles, 10 new English. Quantity of new tack. For information phone 640-4198.

43. Poultry for Sale 30 WHITE Leg Horn pullets, 30 weeks old, laying well, \$2.50 each or make an offer, 649-5046.

44. Building Trades

58. Business Services

K. W. Weiss DENTURE THERAPY CLINIC 30 Wellington St. E. Markham, Ont. 294-6155

47. Meats; Produce for Sale FREEZER ORDERS Grain Fed Beef & Pork sides or quarters. CUSTOM CUTTING RON HILTS 649-2476. TFS1

SIDE of beef, grade A quality, cut and wrapped. Lloyd Harrison Uxbridge 852-3798.

48. Pets and Kennels PROFESSIONAL clipping and grooming. All breeds. Reasonable charge. 294-2528. TF45

Obedience training daily, results, 30 years experience. German Shepherds, adults, puppies, all ages. 1-455-3303.

ALL BREED grooming; poodles our specialty, pick up and delivery available, 294-5758 or 297-2007. 6W12

WIMBERWAY KENNELS Labrador Retrievers. Pups & young adults for sale. Study service to approved bitches. Obedience trainings - all breeds. Field training for retrievers. DOGS & CATS BOARDED Sandy Briggs 649-3040.

SAMOYED Puppies for sale "Pure white" for balls. C.K.C. Reg'd; shots, tattooed, wormed. See both sire and dam. \$150.00 (Mount Albert) 1-473-3025

PUPPIES free to a good home. Collie Shepherd. Call 294-1939.

FREE - Part German Shepherd and Collie 9 month old male. 640-1518.

49. Miscellaneous Canadian Cancer Society Stouffville Branch For information regarding patient services, films, call Stouffville PRESIDENT 640-2734 Service Patients 640-4467 Im Memoriams 640-2826. TF21

CASSETTE TAPE COPYING service for Church conference, large information call Doug, 640-3820.

53. Personals MRS. HELEN - Gifted card and palm reader will advise on all problems. For a private reading call Toronto 465-3777 daily from 10.00 a.m. - 9.00 p.m. 2W19

54. Legal Notices IN THE MATTER OF THE MECHANICS' LIEN ACT, R.S.O. 1970, c. 287. AND IN THE MATTER OF THE INKKEEPERS' ACT, R.S.O. 1970, c. 233. TAKE NOTICE that Donald J. Maiorano, of Pompano Beach, Florida, is indebted to Miss Robin Adele Carver of Gormley, Ontario, in the sum of \$2,500.00 for care and improvement of a horse, which the said Donald J. Maiorano owns and which was brought to stable at Robin Adele Carver's identifiable through the Arabian Horse Registry of America Inc. at R.H. MIRAGA NO. 10475; and in that the said Robin Adele Carver has remained unpaid for more than three months, pursuant to Section 48 of The Mechanics' Lien Act, R.S.O. 1970, c. 287, and pursuant to Section 31 of The Inkkeepers' Act, R.S.O. 1970, c. 233, a SALE of the said horse will be held by public auction on the 29th day of September, 1976, at the hour of 10:30 a.m. in the Windsor Stock Farm, R. R. No. 1, Hillsdale, Ontario conducted by Ross E. Hughes, Sheriff. DATED at Toronto, this 7th day of September, 1976. HASSARD, ELLIOTT, 401 Bay Street, Suite 2500, Toronto, Ontario. Solicitors for Robin Adele Carver. TO: DONALD J. MAIORANO, Lock Lomond Apartments, 500 N.W. 34th Street, Apartment 111, Pompano Beach, Florida, U.S.A. 33064.

56. Private Tuition AN ALTERNATE system school in beginning area. We would be pleased to have interest from interested people. Please contact Lynda Hayward. 852-7507.

PIANO, Guitler Theory Lessons. In the Markham area, by experienced teachers. Call Alan Davey 266-1155.

59. Lost and Found \$200 REWARD For information leading to return of missing school bell from Schoolhouse on Kennedy Road in Unionville. 297-2300 897-5241

60. Auctions Auction Sale Saturday, Sept. 18 12:30 P.M. Clearing Farm Auction of high quality John Deere Farm Machinery, Some Antique Furniture, Elect. Appliances, Etc., The Property of John J. W. Located 1/2 mile East of Myrtle, on Durham Regional Rd. No. 5 (formerly 9th Con.) Approx. 4 Miles North of Brooklin. Partial list includes: Oak Curved Glass China Cabinet (a beauty); China Cabinet (a beauty); Oak Carved Buffet; Oak Dresser w/mirror; Pine Blanket Box; Press Back High Chairs; Wicker Pram; Hand Made Oak Bed; Treadle Sewing Machine; Quant. of Old Collectible Toys; Dome Trunk; Books; Iron Kettle; Trunks; McCarty "Royal Charm" Coal & Wood Stove; Speed Queen Washer; Woods Freezer; Elect. Heater; John-Deere "1020" Tractor Complete; New 1975 Ford (like new) only 712 Hrs.; J.D. Rotary Mower; J.D. 3 Furrow Trip Beam Plow (14"); J-D Model "R" Spreader; J-D Cultivator "10"; J-D Post Hole Digger (11"); J. Materiel (1) Bucket 7"; 3 P.H. Attach. Box; Grain Auger; 4 Sect. Harrows; Hay Tedder; Bale Fork; Seed Drill; 3 Drum Land Roller; Trailer; Scales; Old Fanning Mills; Grain Bagger; 10 New Ford Reg'd. Buses; Viceroy; P.H. Circular Saw w/extra Blades; Quant. of Lumber; Tools; Forks, Shovels, Etc. Ladders; Iron Pump and Many More Misc. Items. Everything in this sale has been carefully selected and Machinery is just like new. Terms Cash. No Reserve. Property Sold. Refreshments Available. Kahn Auction Services - Ph. 985-8161 2W16

Monday, September 20th 12:30 p.m. Furniture and store goods, auction sale including ladders, 3 sp. bicycle, child's high rise bicycle, Duro jet pump, antique cast iron boiler, child's play school desk, barbecue, hibachi, weed sprayer, trailer, 9 x 12 rug, 7 x 50 binoculars, 4 cycle lawn mower, (New this spring), antique hand drawn tire dept. hose reel with hose, wrenches, stainless steel parts box, stove fixtures, hangers, dress racks, wood stove, car radar sentry, 35 mm remote controlled Argus projector plus cartridges, C. E. refrigerator, a freezer combination, old books and sheet music, Indian brass coffee table, new ladies blouses, sweaters, slacks, running shoes, cosmetics, ice packs (all sizes), toys, antique cast iron boiler, table, pictures, Webster air compressor, doors, double hung wood sash and frame aluminum storms, 8' wood grain counter top and sink, tops, coloured bath and sink, white bath, sink and toilet, mattress and box spring, maple desk, stove hoods and fans, chrome and leatherette arm chairs, solid leather chesterfield, wicker covered lugs, 20 lengths new 1/2" copper pipe, 1/2" brass pipe, glass, and many other articles. The property of Tom Siegrist, Uxbridge. Sale behind IGA in parking lot. Sale at 12:30. Lloyd Wilson, Sale Manager and Auctioneer, Uxbridge, 852-3524. TF26

Saturday September 25 12 Noon Farm Sold Auction sale including 25 Head of cattle, 22 steers, charolais X Herefords (1-2 yr. olds), Holstein Heifer due in October, MF 165 Diesel Tractor with cab and power, 1/2" Wagon & Bed, 47 Haybind; 7 (like New), N.H. 273 Hay baler, Oliver side rake, Int. No. 363 furrow T.B. plow, Int. No. 45 Vibra-Shank Cultivator (3 pt. hitch) JD No. 34 Manure Spreader-2 yrs. Wagon & Bed and extra 1/2" run seed drill, Sedore Snow Blower (like new), Int. Side Rake, Gehl Hammer Mill, & Belt, 5 sections of harrows, 32' hay elevator on carriage, grain augers, land roller, hay buncher, Cockshill mounted mower, JD riding lawn mower (good), cattle clippers & dehorners, 2 farrowing crates, single plow, AC No. 46 Combine, Int. Insilage Cutter, set of Sleighs, extension ladder, pile of rails, mineral feeder, electric fence posts, wagon load, 2500 bales of hay. FURNITURE - Heintzman Piano & Bench (excellent condition), organ stool, wicker fern stand, 2 dressers, Moffat 30" stove, kitchen cupboard, tables, bath tub, laundry tubs, washing machine, 2 large crocks, windows & doors; jars, fruit jars & numerous other items. The Property of IRWIN KYDD, R. R. 1, Uxbridge, Lot. 9, Con. 4, 1/2 mile north of Sandford. Owner and Auctioneer not responsible for accidents or public liability. Lunch Available. Sale at 12 noon - sharp. Lloyd Wilson, Sale Manager & Auctioneer, Uxbridge, 416-852-3524. 3W16

"Heronpage Country Auctions", every Wed. evening at 7:00 a.m. - located 4 miles North of Rouge Hill on the Altona Road, Off No. 2 Highway (East Metro); or 4 miles East and South of Markham. Featuring every week: Good selection of antiques; fine furniture; glass; china; collectables, etc. So join us every Wed. and participate in one of Ontario's most authentic, old fashioned auctions, with no bid-ins or reserves. The "True" Auction. Preview all day Wed. Consignment, call: Kahn Auction Service, Ph. 294-0426 (Bus.) or 985-8161 (Res.) TF36

Auctioneers - W.D. ATKINSON 640-1494 Stouffville U.S.A. FARMER Phone Gormley 887-5311 DON BURD 640-2928 BRYAN GREEN MILLIKEN Phone 297-4133

60. Auctions WED., SEPT. 22 Auction sale of furniture and antiques. The property of TED MAIRS, will be held in the town of Cannington, 47 Cameron St. West. G. E. retractor, 114 cubic ft., frost free, good, freezing unit in the bottom. General electric stove. General Electric (top line); newest gold washer and dryer; 5 pc. chrome kitchen set, (excellent condition); 1 year old; oak dining room suite, table, buffet and 6 chairs; 2500 condition; Gerhard Heintzman piano and bench, (excellent condition); G. E. window type air conditioner, 5,000 B.T.U.; coffee table and 2 occasional tables; child's desk and chair; G. E. 1100 w/ sealer. Double bed spring and mattress; continental beds 39" head boards; rowing exercising machine; old dressers; teak dresser; oak corner china cabinet, (good); several panes of glass in door. Many other articles. Terms: cash sale. To see, only 712 Hrs.; J.D. Rotary Mower; J.D. 3 Furrow Trip Beam Plow (14"); J-D Model "R" Spreader; J-D Cultivator "10"; J-D Post Hole Digger (11"); J. Materiel (1) Bucket 7"; 3 P.H. Attach. Box; Grain Auger; 4 Sect. Harrows; Hay Tedder; Bale Fork; Seed Drill; 3 Drum Land Roller; Trailer; Scales; Old Fanning Mills; Grain Bagger; 10 New Ford Reg'd. Buses; Viceroy; P.H. Circular Saw w/extra Blades; Quant. of Lumber; Tools; Forks, Shovels, Etc. Ladders; Iron Pump and Many More Misc. Items. Everything in this sale has been carefully selected and Machinery is just like new. Terms Cash. No Reserve. Property Sold. Refreshments Available. Kahn Auction Services - Ph. 985-8161 2W16

Monday, September 20th 12:30 p.m. Furniture and store goods, auction sale including ladders, 3 sp. bicycle, child's high rise bicycle, Duro jet pump, antique cast iron boiler, child's play school desk, barbecue, hibachi, weed sprayer, trailer, 9 x 12 rug, 7 x 50 binoculars, 4 cycle lawn mower, (New this spring), antique hand drawn tire dept. hose reel with hose, wrenches, stainless steel parts box, stove fixtures, hangers, dress racks, wood stove, car radar sentry, 35 mm remote controlled Argus projector plus cartridges, C. E. refrigerator, a freezer combination, old books and sheet music, Indian brass coffee table, new ladies blouses, sweaters, slacks, running shoes, cosmetics, ice packs (all sizes), toys, antique cast iron boiler, table, pictures, Webster air compressor, doors, double hung wood sash and frame aluminum storms, 8' wood grain counter top and sink, tops, coloured bath and sink, white bath, sink and toilet, mattress and box spring, maple desk, stove hoods and fans, chrome and leatherette arm chairs, solid leather chesterfield, wicker covered lugs, 20 lengths new 1/2" copper pipe, 1/2" brass pipe, glass, and many other articles. The property of Tom Siegrist, Uxbridge. Sale behind IGA in parking lot. Sale at 12:30. Lloyd Wilson, Sale Manager and Auctioneer, Uxbridge, 852-3524. TF26

Saturday September 25 12 Noon Farm Sold Auction sale including 25 Head of cattle, 22 steers, charolais X Herefords (1-2 yr. olds), Holstein Heifer due in October, MF 165 Diesel Tractor with cab and power, 1/2" Wagon & Bed, 47 Haybind; 7 (like New), N.H. 273 Hay baler, Oliver side rake, Int. No. 363 furrow T.B. plow, Int. No. 45 Vibra-Shank Cultivator (3 pt. hitch) JD No. 34 Manure Spreader-2 yrs. Wagon & Bed and extra 1/2" run seed drill, Sedore Snow Blower (like new), Int. Side Rake, Gehl Hammer Mill, & Belt, 5 sections of harrows, 32' hay elevator on carriage, grain augers, land roller, hay buncher, Cockshill mounted mower, JD riding lawn mower (good), cattle clippers & dehorners, 2 farrowing crates, single plow, AC No. 46 Combine, Int. Insilage Cutter, set of Sleighs, extension ladder, pile of rails, mineral feeder, electric fence posts, wagon load, 2500 bales of hay. FURNITURE - Heintzman Piano & Bench (excellent condition), organ stool, wicker fern stand, 2 dressers, Moffat 30" stove, kitchen cupboard, tables, bath tub, laundry tubs, washing machine, 2 large crocks, windows & doors; jars, fruit jars & numerous other items. The Property of IRWIN KYDD, R. R. 1, Uxbridge, Lot. 9, Con. 4, 1/2 mile north of Sandford. Owner and Auctioneer not responsible for accidents or public liability. Lunch Available. Sale at 12 noon - sharp. Lloyd Wilson, Sale Manager & Auctioneer, Uxbridge, 416-852-3524. 3W16

"Heronpage Country Auctions", every Wed. evening at 7:00 a.m. - located 4 miles North of Rouge Hill on the Altona Road, Off No. 2 Highway (East Metro); or 4 miles East and South of Markham. Featuring every week: Good selection of antiques; fine furniture; glass; china; collectables, etc. So join us every Wed. and participate in one of Ontario's most authentic, old fashioned auctions, with no bid-ins or reserves. The "True" Auction. Preview all day Wed. Consignment, call: Kahn Auction Service, Ph. 294-0426 (Bus.) or 985-8161 (Res.) TF36

Auctioneers - W.D. ATKINSON 640-1494 Stouffville U.S.A. FARMER Phone Gormley 887-5311 DON BURD 640-2928 BRYAN GREEN MILLIKEN Phone 297-4133

60. Auctions WED., SEPT. 22 Auction sale of furniture and antiques. The property of TED MAIRS, will be held in the town of Cannington, 47 Cameron St. West. G. E. retractor, 114 cubic ft., frost free, good, freezing unit in the bottom. General electric stove. General Electric (top line); newest gold washer and dryer; 5 pc. chrome kitchen set, (excellent condition); 1 year old; oak dining room suite, table, buffet and 6 chairs; 2500 condition; Gerhard Heintzman piano and bench, (excellent condition); G. E. window type air conditioner, 5,000 B.T.U.; coffee table and 2 occasional tables; child's desk and chair; G. E. 1100 w/ sealer. Double bed spring and mattress; continental beds 39" head boards; rowing exercising machine; old dressers; teak dresser; oak corner china cabinet, (good); several panes of glass in door. Many other articles. Terms: cash sale. To see, only 712 Hrs.; J.D. Rotary Mower; J.D. 3 Furrow Trip Beam Plow (14"); J-D Model "R" Spreader; J-D Cultivator "10"; J-D Post Hole Digger (11"); J. Materiel (1) Bucket 7"; 3 P.H. Attach. Box; Grain Auger; 4 Sect. Harrows; Hay Tedder; Bale Fork; Seed Drill; 3 Drum Land Roller; Trailer; Scales; Old Fanning Mills; Grain Bagger; 10 New Ford Reg'd. Buses; Viceroy; P.H. Circular Saw w/extra Blades; Quant. of Lumber; Tools; Forks, Shovels, Etc. Ladders; Iron Pump and Many More Misc. Items. Everything in this sale has been carefully selected and Machinery is just like new. Terms Cash. No Reserve. Property Sold. Refreshments Available. Kahn Auction Services - Ph. 985-8161 2W16

Monday, September 20th 12:30 p.m. Furniture and store goods, auction sale including ladders, 3 sp. bicycle, child's high rise bicycle, Duro jet pump, antique cast iron boiler, child's play school desk, barbecue, hibachi, weed sprayer, trailer, 9 x 12 rug, 7 x 50 binoculars, 4 cycle lawn mower, (New this spring), antique hand drawn tire dept. hose reel with hose, wrenches, stainless steel parts box, stove fixtures, hangers, dress racks, wood stove, car radar sentry, 35 mm remote controlled Argus projector plus cartridges, C. E. refrigerator, a freezer combination, old books and sheet music, Indian brass coffee table, new ladies blouses, sweaters, slacks, running shoes, cosmetics, ice packs (all sizes), toys, antique cast iron boiler, table, pictures, Webster air compressor, doors, double hung wood sash and frame aluminum storms, 8' wood grain counter top and sink, tops, coloured bath and sink, white bath, sink and toilet, mattress and box spring, maple desk, stove hoods and fans, chrome and leatherette arm chairs, solid leather chesterfield, wicker covered lugs, 20 lengths new 1/2" copper pipe, 1/2" brass pipe, glass, and many other articles. The property of Tom Siegrist, Uxbridge. Sale behind IGA in parking lot. Sale at 12:30. Lloyd Wilson, Sale Manager and Auctioneer, Uxbridge, 852-3524. TF26

Saturday September 25 12 Noon Farm Sold Auction sale including 25 Head of cattle, 22 steers, charolais X Herefords (1-2 yr. olds), Holstein Heifer due in October, MF 165 Diesel Tractor with cab and power, 1/2" Wagon & Bed, 47 Haybind; 7 (like New), N.H. 273 Hay baler, Oliver side rake, Int. No. 363 furrow T.B. plow, Int. No. 45 Vibra-Shank Cultivator (3 pt. hitch) JD No. 34 Manure Spreader-2 yrs. Wagon & Bed and extra 1/2" run seed drill, Sedore Snow Blower (like new), Int. Side Rake, Gehl Hammer Mill, & Belt, 5 sections of harrows, 32' hay elevator on carriage, grain augers, land roller, hay buncher, Cockshill mounted mower, JD riding lawn mower (good), cattle clippers & dehorners, 2 farrowing crates, single plow, AC No. 46 Combine, Int. Insilage Cutter, set of Sleighs, extension ladder, pile of rails, mineral feeder, electric fence posts, wagon load, 2500 bales of hay. FURNITURE - Heintzman Piano & Bench (excellent condition), organ stool, wicker fern stand, 2 dressers, Moffat 30" stove, kitchen cupboard, tables, bath tub, laundry tubs, washing machine, 2 large crocks, windows & doors; jars, fruit jars & numerous other items. The Property of IRWIN KYDD, R. R. 1, Uxbridge, Lot. 9, Con. 4, 1/2 mile north of Sandford. Owner and Auctioneer not responsible for accidents or public liability. Lunch Available. Sale at 12 noon - sharp. Lloyd Wilson, Sale Manager & Auctioneer, Uxbridge, 416-852-3524. 3W16

"Heronpage Country Auctions", every Wed. evening at 7:00 a.m. - located 4 miles North of Rouge Hill on the Altona Road, Off No. 2 Highway (East Metro); or 4 miles East and South of Markham. Featuring every week: Good selection of antiques; fine furniture; glass; china; collectables, etc. So join us every Wed. and participate in one of Ontario's most authentic, old fashioned auctions, with no bid-ins or reserves. The "True" Auction. Preview all day Wed. Consignment, call: Kahn Auction Service, Ph. 294-0426 (Bus.) or 985-8161 (Res.) TF36

Auctioneers - W.D. ATKINSON 640-1494 Stouffville U.S.A. FARMER Phone Gormley 887-5311 DON BURD 640-2928 BRYAN GREEN MILLIKEN Phone 297-4133

60. Auctions TWILIGHT AUCTION SALE Friday, Sept. 24 at 6.30 p.m. In the Victoria Square Community Centre, being 3 miles north of No. 7 Hwy. on Don Mills Rd. Sale of antiques; furniture; clocks; collectable items: 2 pianos (Dominion Player Piano - working - Bell upright); Sealer collection, (1 Beehive, 2 Beavers, 1 star, 2 Best King, The Weavers, The Daisies, The Ideal Acme Etc.); Brass bed; round oak table; antique wooden telephone; finger lamps; school clock; gingerbread clock; wall clocks; 2 planters peanut jars; set of 6 pressed back chairs; domestic strook carpets; mahogany high boy dressers with bevelled mirror; mahogany dresser; spool bed; Ice cream parlour set, (4 chairs & table); men's double dresser with mirror; pressed back rocker; pine washstand; pine blank box; oak hall table; piano stool with glass; oak hall set; curved glass china cabinet; plant stands; copper kettles; brass; pr. of Doullon flow blue plates; lanterns; crocks; decays; orange crush bottles; tea tins; 2 carnival dishes; 2 hump back trunks; wooden beer keg; brass horns; hames; gunstock chair; 3 pc. settee; mirrors; wuggy wheel; coffee table; cast iron terrier; milk bottles; oak office desk; 2 drawer chest; 10 & 15 gal. crocks; pine document chest; plus numerous other articles. Terms cash. no reserve. Call John Annis 985-3477 Auctioneers.

Monday, September 20th 12:30 p.m. Furniture and store goods, auction sale including ladders, 3 sp. bicycle, child's high rise bicycle, Duro jet pump, antique cast iron boiler, child's play school desk, barbecue, hibachi, weed sprayer, trailer, 9 x 12 rug, 7 x 50 binoculars, 4 cycle lawn mower, (New this spring), antique hand drawn tire dept. hose reel with hose, wrenches, stainless steel parts box, stove fixtures, hangers, dress racks, wood stove, car radar sentry, 35 mm remote controlled Argus projector plus cartridges, C. E. refrigerator, a freezer combination, old books and sheet music, Indian brass coffee table, new ladies blouses, sweaters, slacks, running shoes, cosmetics, ice packs (all sizes), toys, antique cast iron boiler, table, pictures, Webster air compressor, doors, double hung wood sash and frame aluminum storms, 8' wood grain counter top and sink, tops, coloured bath and sink, white bath, sink and toilet, mattress and box spring, maple desk, stove hoods and fans, chrome and leatherette arm chairs, solid leather chesterfield, wicker covered lugs, 20 lengths new 1/2" copper pipe, 1/2" brass pipe, glass, and many other articles. The property of Tom Siegrist, Uxbridge. Sale behind IGA in parking lot. Sale at 12:30. Lloyd Wilson, Sale Manager and Auctioneer, Uxbridge, 852-3524. TF26

Saturday September 25 12 Noon Farm Sold Auction sale including 25 Head of cattle, 22 steers, charolais X Herefords (1-2 yr. olds), Holstein Heifer due in October, MF 165 Diesel Tractor with cab and power, 1/2" Wagon & Bed, 47 Haybind; 7 (like New), N.H. 273 Hay baler, Oliver side rake, Int. No. 363 furrow T.B. plow, Int. No. 45 Vibra-Shank Cultivator (3 pt. hitch) JD No. 34 Manure Spreader-2 yrs. Wagon & Bed and extra 1/2" run seed drill, Sedore Snow Blower (like new), Int. Side Rake, Gehl Hammer Mill, & Belt, 5 sections of harrows, 32' hay elevator on carriage, grain augers, land roller, hay buncher, Cockshill mounted mower, JD riding lawn mower (good), cattle clippers & dehorners, 2 farrowing crates, single plow, AC No. 46 Combine, Int. Insilage Cutter, set of Sleighs, extension ladder, pile of rails, mineral feeder, electric fence posts, wagon load, 2500 bales of hay. FURNITURE - Heintzman Piano & Bench (excellent condition), organ stool, wicker fern stand, 2 dressers, Moffat 30" stove, kitchen cupboard, tables, bath tub, laundry tubs, washing machine, 2 large crocks, windows & doors; jars, fruit jars & numerous other items. The Property of IRWIN KYDD, R. R. 1, Uxbridge, Lot. 9, Con. 4, 1/2 mile north of Sandford. Owner and Auctioneer not responsible for accidents or public liability. Lunch Available. Sale at 12 noon - sharp. Lloyd Wilson, Sale Manager & Auctioneer, Uxbridge, 416-852-3524. 3W16

"Heronpage Country Auctions", every Wed. evening at 7:00 a.m. - located 4 miles North of Rouge Hill on the Altona Road, Off No. 2 Highway (East Metro); or 4 miles East and South of Markham. Featuring every week: Good selection of antiques; fine furniture; glass; china; collectables, etc. So join us every Wed. and participate in one of Ontario's most authentic, old fashioned auctions, with no bid-ins or reserves. The "True" Auction. Preview all day Wed. Consignment, call: Kahn Auction Service, Ph. 294-0426 (Bus.) or 985-8161 (Res.) TF36

Auctioneers - W.D. ATKINSON 640-1494 Stouffville U.S.A. FARMER Phone Gormley 887-5311 DON BURD 640-2928 BRYAN GREEN MILLIKEN Phone 297-4133

60. Auctions

WED., SEPT. 22 Auction sale of furniture and antiques. The property of TED MAIRS, will be held in the town of Cannington, 47 Cameron St. West. G. E. retractor, 114 cubic ft., frost free, good, freezing unit in the bottom. General electric stove. General Electric (top line); newest gold washer and dryer; 5 pc. chrome kitchen set, (excellent condition); 1 year old; oak dining room suite, table, buffet and 6 chairs; 2500 condition; Gerhard Heintzman piano and bench, (excellent condition); G. E. window type air conditioner, 5,000 B.T.U.; coffee table and 2 occasional tables; child's desk and chair; G. E. 1100 w/ sealer. Double bed spring and mattress; continental beds 39" head boards; rowing exercising machine; old dressers; teak dresser; oak corner china cabinet, (good); several panes of glass in door. Many other articles. Terms: cash sale. To see, only 712 Hrs.; J.D. Rotary Mower; J.D. 3 Furrow Trip Beam Plow (14"); J-D Model "R" Spreader; J-D Cultivator "10"; J-D Post Hole Digger (11"); J. Materiel (1) Bucket 7"; 3 P.H. Attach. Box; Grain Auger; 4 Sect. Harrows; Hay Tedder; Bale Fork; Seed Drill; 3 Drum Land Roller; Trailer; Scales; Old Fanning Mills; Grain Bagger; 10 New Ford Reg'd. Buses; Viceroy; P.H. Circular Saw w/extra Blades; Quant. of Lumber; Tools; Forks, Shovels, Etc. Ladders; Iron Pump and Many More Misc. Items. Everything in this sale has been carefully selected and Machinery is just like new. Terms Cash. No Reserve. Property Sold. Refreshments Available. Kahn Auction Services - Ph. 985-8161 2W16

Monday, September 20th 12:30 p.m. Furniture and store goods, auction sale including ladders, 3 sp. bicycle, child's high rise bicycle, Duro jet pump, antique cast iron boiler, child's play school desk, barbecue, hibachi, weed sprayer, trailer, 9 x 12 rug, 7 x 50 binoculars, 4 cycle lawn mower, (New this spring), antique hand drawn tire dept. hose reel with hose, wrenches, stainless steel parts box, stove fixtures, hangers, dress racks, wood stove, car radar sentry, 35 mm remote controlled Argus projector plus cartridges, C. E. refrigerator, a freezer combination, old books and sheet music, Indian brass coffee table, new ladies blouses, sweaters, slacks, running shoes, cosmetics, ice packs (all sizes), toys, antique cast iron boiler, table, pictures, Webster air compressor, doors, double hung wood sash and frame aluminum storms, 8' wood grain counter top and sink, tops, coloured bath and sink, white bath, sink and toilet, mattress and box spring, maple desk, stove hoods and fans, chrome and leatherette arm chairs, solid leather chesterfield, wicker covered lugs, 20 lengths new 1/2" copper pipe, 1/2" brass pipe, glass, and many other articles. The property of Tom Siegrist, Uxbridge. Sale behind IGA in parking lot. Sale at 12:30. Lloyd Wilson, Sale Manager and Auctioneer, Uxbridge, 852-3524. TF26

Saturday September 25 12 Noon Farm Sold Auction sale including 25 Head of cattle, 22 steers, charolais X Herefords (1-2 yr. olds), Holstein Heifer due in October, MF 165 Diesel Tractor with cab and power, 1/2" Wagon & Bed, 47 Haybind; 7 (like New), N.H. 273 Hay baler, Oliver side rake, Int. No. 363 furrow T.B. plow, Int. No. 45 Vibra-Shank Cultivator (3 pt. hitch) JD No. 34 Manure Spreader-2 yrs. Wagon & Bed and extra 1/2" run seed drill, Sedore Snow Blower (like new), Int. Side Rake, Gehl Hammer Mill, & Belt, 5 sections of harrows, 32' hay elevator on carriage, grain augers, land roller, hay buncher, Cockshill mounted mower, JD riding lawn mower (good), cattle clippers &