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Danika barker

is a secondary English 
and Media Studies 
teacher. She is 
currently pursuing her 
Master’s in Education 
at the UOIT while 
teaching for Thames 
Valley District School 
Board. 

rob baxter

is the teacher-librarian 
at Langstaff Secondary 
School in the York 
Region District School 
Board. 

anita brooks 
kirkland

is a library and 
information 
technology consultant 
with the Waterloo 
District School Board.

wendy 
d’angelo

is the teacher-librarian 
at Wells Street Public 
School in the York 
Region District School 
Board. 

derrick grose

is the teacher-librarian 
at Lisgar Collegiate 
Institute in the Ottawa-
Carleton District 
School Board.

catherine 
harris

is the teacher-librarian 
at William Berczy 
Public School in the 
York Region District 
School Board.

leslie 
holwerda

is the teacher-librarian 
at Lougheed Middle 
School in the Peel 
District School Board.

alanna king

is the teacher-librarian 
and Directions 
Team Leader of 
Informational and 
Digital Literacies at 
Orangeville District 
Secondary School 
in the Upper Grand 
District School Board.

diana 
maliszewski

is the teacher-librarian 
at Agnes Macphail 
Public School in 
the Toronto District 
School Board. 

roger nevin

is a teacher-librarian at 
Adam Scott CVI in the 
Kawartha Pine Ridge 
District School Board, 
and the 2011 OSLA 
President.

Sarah Alinia 
Ziazi

is a high school 
student at Lester B. 
Pearson Collegiate 
Institute in the 
Toronto District 
School Board.

brian pudden

is the Media Co-
ordinator at the 
Ontario Library 
Association

Sandra 
ziemniak

is the teacher-librarian 
at Meadowvale 
Secondary School 
in the Peel District 
School Board. 
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