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Parker selected
to replace Haider
By Tom Gavey

The Intelligencer

A professional management
consultant will fill the vacancy
on the Belleville Police Services
Board.

Monday it was announced
Ted Parker, 62, has been ap-
proved by the provincial cabinet
as the third appointee to the
board.

The board has three provin-
cial appointees and two repre-
sentatives of the city but was
working shorthanded when the
province didn't reappoint Dawn
Haider earlier this year.

Parker says he doesn't know
who nominated him for the posi-
tion but he told the Ministry of
the Solicitor General he would
serve if appointed.

Tm interested in the inner
workings of policing. I want to
see if the police are being treated
fairly and if in turn th^y are
treating the public fairly/ he
says.

Parker retired from Ontario
Hydro after 26 years service in
April, 1992 and- before that
served 15 years in the Royal Ca-
nadian Air Force. He now owns

his own man-
agement con-
sulting com-
pany, T.P.
Management
Studies.

Of aborigi-
nal descent,
his mother
was a Cree
from Lac La
Ronge, Sask.
and Parker
was born in
The Pas,

Ted Parker

Man.
A member of St. Thomas An-

glican Church, where he's been a
warden in the past, he's also in-
volved in the Masonic Lodge and
was a volunteer with the
Belleville Minor Hockey Asso-
ciation in the late 1970s.

Parker's term is for two years.


