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Komputech,
The computer business is

changing all the time and Kom-
putech has managed to keep up
with those changes. For exam-
ple, there is new software for
networks that share CD ROM
technology, and employees
attend courses to stay one step
ahead of the game.

KOMPUTECH now offers
night classes in DOS and Win-
dows. Classes ait ongoing and
there is room for 16 students.
Each student has a computer.

Employers are also urged to
take advantage of the training
programs which are offered
during the day and are tailored
to company requirements.

"I find the business very
interesting;' says Harold. "It's
certainly changing. I find
myself spending a lot of time
getting things ready for the cus-
tomer and a lot of time learning
the changing technology. It's
very rewarding."

Next time, why not try

Komputech president Harold Lambert checks out one of the computers

being assembled. The company is able to accommodate the needs of

individuals and businesses, including networks.

KOMPUTECH for all your
computer and software needs?
It's worth the drive.

KOMPUTECH's hours are

weekdays 9 a.m. to 5 p.m.; Sat-
urdays 9 a.m. to noon. Please
call 476-7523, Belleville 969-
1032, toll free 1-800-267-2854.

Technologist

Rob Olson is

one of the

qualified staff

at Komputech,

now in its

10th year. All

computers are

custom

designed to

meet individ-

ual needs.


